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LOCAL GEOGRAPHY TEACHING AND RESEARCH

paperback. Book Condition: New. Ship out in 2 business day, And Fast shipping, Free Tracking number will be
provided a;er the shipment.Paperback Pages Number: 218 to promote quality education is an urgent task of
China's modernization drive. is a profound reform of education in China. the significant progress of
educational thought and Training Mode. Implementation of the Teachers' Continuing Education Project . to
improve the quality of teachers is the fundamental guarantee to promote quality education. Primary and
Secondary Teachers Continuing Education Course Construction is the key imperative is urgently needed to
design a series for primary and secondary subject teachers continue education model curriculum. the
preparation of a number of continuing education materials. In the compilation of teaching materials. I have
adopted the following practices: (1) organized experts to review continuing education materials to the
provinces (autonomous regions and municipalities) recommended for primary and secondary school teachers.
screened more than 200 species available for teachers to learn to use the excellent textbooks and study
reference books; (2) to organize special preparation of team prepared 61 kinds of teaching materials. including
public compulsory textbooks for primary and secondary ideological and political education regulations.
educational theory. educational technology; primary and secondary languages. mathematics. high school
English discipline of geography. chemistry. biology. elementary school social. natural and other professional
courses materials. The above materials. in the end of 1999. National primary and secondary school teachers
continuing education in 1999 recommended books catalog (in the form of teachers Division [1999] No. 60) to the
country. (3) to the Press. more than 40 tender. organizations and experts in the preparation of teaching
materials for Press tender outline carefully review and screening. initially identified more than 200 kinds of
primary and secondary school teachers continuing education materials. These teaching materials. currently
being prepared by the...
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